Subject: Fwd: Newkirk Casino Grill Installation ADD

” Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>
to Jarrod Parks, Kenneth Crawford

Jerrod,

Just following up. | want to be sure and get the path app in today. Please let me know.
Sincerely,

Christopher T. Wilson

D: (405) 215-7726
heartlandsportsturf.com

---------- Forwarded message -------—--

From: <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Date: Fri, Sep 15, 2023 at 10:42 AM

Subject: RE: Newkirk Casino Grill Installation ADD

To: Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>

CC: <jason@heartlandsportsturf.com>, <kenneth@bcmsports.net>, J Lyn Wilson <wilsonjlyn7@gmail.com>, Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>, Eden Evans <ee

Jerrod,
Please see quotes attached for Change Orders #1 and #2.

Regarding CO #2, We can’t add installation of (15) Picnic Tables for free. We need a minimum for $1,875 for that portion, as it is added time. That is reflected in the revis
questions or need more information.

Regarding the pay app that is due September 18" which I'm working on putting together now — | have a couple of questions:

1. CO1 should be included on this pay-app, correct?
2. Should CO2 be included since the work will be completed prior to next months pay-app date?

Please let me know so | can ensure everything is reflected and processed accordingly.
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