
Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Fwd: Newkirk Casino Grill Installation ADD
7 messages

Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com> Thu, Sep 14, 2023 at 8:20 AM
To: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>, jason@heartlandsportsturf.com

Jason,

Let me know if you get this…

Jason@heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com isn’t recognized as a valid address…

Ken, Jason is not receiving his emails at Jason@heartlandsportsturf.com

Christopher T. Wilson
D: (405) 215-7726
chris@heartlandsportsturf.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>
Date: Thu, Sep 14, 2023 at 12:56 AM
Subject: Newkirk Casino Grill Installation ADD
To: <jparks@scottandreid.com>
CC: <jason@heartlandsportsturf.com>, <kenneth@bcmsports.net>, J Lyn Wilson <wilsonjlyn7@gmail.com>

Jerrod,

 

Per your request, please see quote attached for us to ADD the Grill Installation. Please let us know if you have any questions.

 

Sincerely,

 

Christopher T. Wilson

Heartland Sports Turf

D: (405) 215-7726

Heartlandsportsturf.com
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Newkirk Casino Grill Installation ADD Quote 09-14-23.pdf
93K

Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com> Mon, Sep 18, 2023 at 7:22 AM
To: Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>
Cc: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Jerrod,

Just following up. I want to be sure and get the path app in today. Please let me know.

Sincerely,

Christopher T. Wilson
D: (405) 215-7726
heartlandsportsturf.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>
Date: Fri, Sep 15, 2023 at 10:42 AM
Subject: RE: Newkirk Casino Grill Installation ADD
To: Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>
CC: <jason@heartlandsportsturf.com>, <kenneth@bcmsports.net>, J Lyn Wilson <wilsonjlyn7@gmail.com>, Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>, Eden Evans
<eevans@scottandreid.com>, David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>

Jerrod,

 

Please see quotes attached for Change Orders #1 and #2.

 

Regarding CO #2, We can’t add installation of (15) Picnic Tables for free. We need a minimum for $1,875 for that portion, as it is added time. That is reflected in the revised
C0#2R1 attached. Please review and let me know if you have any questions or need more information.

 

Regarding the pay app that is due September 18th, which I’m working on putting together now – I have a couple of questions:

 

1. CO1 should be included on this pay-app, correct?
2. Should CO2 be included since the work will be completed prior to next months pay-app date?

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=6bc6de5cfc&view=att&th=18a93da01a25cbbe&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=18a93d46934dcd806e81&safe=1&zw
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Please let me know so I can ensure everything is reflected and processed accordingly.

 

Sincerely,

 

Christopher T. Wilson

D: (405) 215-7726

Heartlandsportsturf.com

 



From: Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>
Sent: Friday, September 15, 2023 9:04 AM
To: chris@heartlandsportsturf.com
Cc: jason@heartlandsportsturf.com; kenneth@bcmsports.net; 'J Lyn Wilson' <wilsonjlyn7@gmail.com>; Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>; Eden Evans
<eevans@scottandreid.com>; David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>
Subject: Re: Newkirk Casino Grill Installation ADD

 

Can you include the Picnic Table install within this pricing and return? They will be anchored down with hardware provided by the manufacturer.

 

Thanks 

 

Jarrod Parks | Superintendent

Scott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.

Mobile 918.720.8464

jparks@scottandreid.com | [www
.scottandreid.com]www.scottandreid.com

 

CONFIDENTIAL & PRIVILEGED: Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the nature of the following communication, the information contained

herein is privileged and confidential information/work product. The communication is intended for the use of the individual or entity named

above.  If the reader of this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of

this communication is strictly prohibited.  If you have received this communication in error or are unsure whether it is privileged, please

immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy any copies, electronic, paper, or otherwise, which you may have of this communication.

 

From: chris@heartlandsportsturf.com <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 14, 2023 12:56 AM
To: Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>
Cc: jason@heartlandsportsturf.com <jason@heartlandsportsturf.com>; kenneth@bcmsports.net <kenneth@bcmsports.net>; 'J Lyn Wilson' <wilsonjlyn7@gmail.com>
Subject: Newkirk Casino Grill Installation ADD
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 EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.

[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

CO#1 Newkirk Casino RV Park Labor ADD Quote 09-15-23.pdf
63K

CO#2R1 Newkirk Casino RV Park Grill & Table Install ADD Quote 09-15-23.pdf
61K

chris@heartlandsportsturf.com <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com> Fri, Sep 29, 2023 at 3:54 PM
To: Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>, Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>
Cc: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Jerrod / Brian,

 

Can either of you let me know where we’re at on these? I haven’t seen any response or feedback and we’re nearing the end of this first phase.

 

Also, the initial agreement was to install the tables only – however we’ve ended up assembling and installing them. The assembly added 15-man hours (3 men / 5 hours each)
and our intention is to process a charge order for that time. Is that a problem?

 

Please get back to me and let me know as soon as possible.

 

Sincerely,

 

Christopher T. Wilson

Partner

D: (405) 215-7726
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Heartlandsportsturf.com
[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

CO#1 Newkirk Casino RV Park Labor ADD Quote 09-15-23.pdf
63K

CO#2R1 Newkirk Casino RV Park Grill & Table Install ADD Quote 09-15-23.pdf
61K

Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com> Sat, Sep 30, 2023 at 1:09 PM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>, Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>
Cc: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>, "chris@heartlandsportsturf.com" <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>,
Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>

Dave or Eden,

Do you know where these are? 

Thanks

Jarrod Parks
Superintendent

   
M 918.720.8464
jparks@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com 

CONFIDENTIAL & PRIVILEGED: Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the nature of the following communication, the
information contained herein is privileged and confidential information/work product. The communication is intended for the use
of the individual or entity named above.  If the reader of this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited.   If you have received this
communication in error or are not sure whether it is privileged, please immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy any
copies, electronic, paper or otherwise, which you may have of this communication.
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From: chris@heartlandsportsturf.com <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>
Sent: Friday, September 29, 2023 3:54 PM
To: Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>; Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>
Cc: 'Jason McMahan' <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>; 'Kenneth Crawford' <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>
Subject: FW: Newkirk Casino Grill Installation ADD
 
[Quoted text hidden]

Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com> Sat, Sep 30, 2023 at 1:13 PM
To: Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>, David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>, Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>
Cc: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>, "chris@heartlandsportsturf.com" <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Let's get these processed first thing Monday, so we can get these guys paid quickly.

Our invoices and changes need to get processed quicker, so the Trade Contractors can bill for work completed.  

Thanks,

Brian Travis
Senior Project Manager

   
P 918.359.2752  M 918.404.0642
btravis@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com 

CONFIDENTIAL & PRIVILEGED: Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the nature of the following communication, the
information contained herein is privileged and confidential information/work product. The communication is intended for the use
of the individual or entity named above.  If the reader of this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited.   If you have received this
communication in error or are not sure whether it is privileged, please immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy any
copies, electronic, paper or otherwise, which you may have of this communication.

From: Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>
Sent: Saturday, September 30, 2023 1:09:48 PM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>; Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>
Cc: 'Jason McMahan' <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>; 'Kenneth Crawford' <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>; chris@heartlandsportsturf.com
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<chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>; Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>
[Quoted text hidden]
 
[Quoted text hidden]

4 attachments
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4K
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82K

Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com> Sat, Sep 30, 2023 at 1:21 PM
To: Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>
Cc: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>, Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>, Jarrod Parks <jparks@scottandreid.com>, Jason McMahan
<heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Thank you Brian!

Christopher T. Wilson
D: (405) 215-7726
heartlandsportsturf.com
[Quoted text hidden]

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Sun, Oct 1, 2023 at 5:21 AM
To: Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>, Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@bcmsports.net>

Thank you Brian for all you do in helping us navigate the process. I’m excited to get some turf down soon and brighten the place up. This project has met some challenges but I
believe it builds character and strengthens relationships. You’ve got a good staff working for you & with you, Blessed. If I can be of any assistance please let me know. 

If S&R are in need for additional subcontractors in the future please consider a couple recommendations. 

———————
I have developed some really good relationships over last 5-6 years with a few gentlemen thru the sports complex build. If you’re in need for electrical I would recommend Ky
(405-532-6861) with KB Electric or William (405-650-8272) Sewar, water, concrete, parking lot, contact William Adcock (AB Construction).
———————

4EVER13,

Kenneth Crawford
405-642-9592
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On Sat, Sep 30, 2023 at 1:13 PM Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]
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