@: ’ . Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Re: Otoe Missouria RV Park Material Delivery Dates

8 messages

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@bcmsports.net> Wed, Jul 26, 2023 at 11:44 AM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>, Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com

David,

| have spoken with Sobber Brothers & Turf Hub about lead times and delivery dates.

Sobber Bro will need 2 business days (Aug 30-31) and we can schedule Turf delivery for the same timeframe as well.
Kenneth

On Wed, Jul 26, 2023 at 9:35 AM David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com> wrote:
Good Morning,

Thank you for taking my call earlier today. As we spoke on the phone, please send me TODAY your committed delivery dates for all of your
materials (itemized per vendor) so we can ensure our project is completed on time. Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns
regarding your materials.

Thank you

David McLain | Project Engineer
CELEBRATING

mScott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.
Mobile 918.327.0149

YEARS

dmclain@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

CONFIDENTIAL & PRIVILEGED: Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the nature of the following communication, the information contained
herein is privileged and confidential information/work product. The communication is intended for the use of the individual or entity named
above. If the reader of this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error or are unsure whether it is privileged, please
immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy any copies, electronic, paper, or otherwise, which you may have of this communication.
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Kenneth Crawford
405-642-9592
BCMSports.net

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Wed, Jul 26, 2023 at 12:12 PM
To: Tami Jackson <tjackson@scottandreid.com>

Email traffic for.
[Quoted text hidden]

Kenneth R. Crawford
HeartlandSportsTurf.com
405-642-9592

Brian Crawford Memorial
BCM Sports

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@bcmsports.net> Wed, Jul 26, 2023 at 10:31 PM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>, kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com, Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, jason@heartlandsportsturf.com

See attachment...

David - Does Heartland Sports Turf have the authorization from Owner to purchase materials? I’'m under the impression we are waiting on an official document with authorization
from Scott & Reed. Once we have authorization we will submit an order for payment or coordinate with Tami for direct payment for materials.

[Quoted text hidden]

Kenneth Crawford

+1 405 642 9592
BCMSports.net

ﬂ 7 Clans Materials Committed Delivery Dates.pdf
330K

David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com> Thu, Jul 27, 2023 at 8:39 AM
To: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@bcmsports.net>, "kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com" <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>, Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>,
"jason@heartlandsportsturf.com" <jason@heartlandsportsturf.com>, Tami Jackson <tjackson@scottandreid.com>

Kenneth,

| will call you after this meeting | am in is over. But as we discussed yesterday, get your vendor to deliver you material for August 31 for the turf. After
delivery when the turf company sends you the invoice, forward the invoice to me and Tami so that we can give the invoice to the client to pay.

Also, can you get me a sample of the turf we are using at this project so | can get it to the Architect for their records.


mailto:Kenneth@HeartlandSportsTurf.com
http://www.heartlandsportsturf.com/
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Thank you

David McLain | Project Engineer

CELEBRATING
g- m Scott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.
\ 1

Mobile 918.327.0149
YEARS

dmclain@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

From: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@bcmsports.net>

Sent: Wednesday, July 26, 2023 10:31 PM

To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>; kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>; Jason McMahan
<heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>; jason@heartlandsportsturf.com <jason@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Subject: Re: Otoe Missouria RV Park Material Delivery Dates

EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.
[Quoted text hidden]

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Thu, Jul 27, 2023 at 9:43 AM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>

| can but was under the impression that sample was given in the initial process.

Ken
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com> Thu, Jul 27, 2023 at 4:23 PM
To: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Kenneth,

| cannot find any sample here at our office. Could you send another?

Thank you
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David McLain | Project Engineer

CELEBRATING
g- m Scott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.
\ o [\ Mobile 918.327.0149

YEARS
dmclain@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

From: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 27, 2023 9:43 AM

To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>

What address do | send it to?
[Quoted text hidden]

Fri, Jul 28, 2023 at 7:48 AM

David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>
To: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

10462 S. 82" East Ave, Suite 106
Tulsa, OK 74133

David McLain | Project Engineer

CELEBRATING
¢' m Scott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.
\ o [\ Mobile 918.327.0149

YEARS
dmclain@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

Fri, Jul 28, 2023 at 8:23 AM
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From: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>
Sent: Friday, July 28, 2023 7:48 AM

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]
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