
Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Estimate 3697 from TurfHub Dallas, LLC
14 messages

daryl@turfhub.com <daryl@turfhub.com> Thu, Jul 20, 2023 at 1:37 PM
To: heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com, kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com, dmclain@scottandreid.com

Dear Jason MacMahan:

Please review the attached estimate- 3697. Feel free to contact us if you have any questions.

We look forward to working with you.

Sincerely,
TurfHub Dallas, LLC

972-245-1566

Est_3697_from_TurfHub_Dallas_LLC_6648.pdf
232K

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Thu, Jul 20, 2023 at 1:46 PM
To: daryl@turfhub.com

Otoe-Missouria Tribe 7 Clans First Council Casino and RV Park, 12875 North Highway 77, Newkirk, Ok. 74647 
[Quoted text hidden]
--
Kenneth R. Crawford
HeartlandSportsTurf.com
405-642-9592
Brian Crawford Memorial 
BCM Sports

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Fri, Jul 21, 2023 at 9:45 AM
To: tjackson@scottandreid.com

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

Est_3697_from_TurfHub_Dallas_LLC_6648.pdf
232K
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David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com> Fri, Jul 21, 2023 at 9:54 AM
To: "daryl@turfhub.com" <daryl@turfhub.com>, "heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com" <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, "kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com"
<kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>
Cc: Tami Jackson <tjackson@scottandreid.com>

Daryl,

Can you send me your W9 as well?

Also, who will be the point of contact for purchasing so I can give that to our client?

Thank you 

David McLain | Project Engineer

Scott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.

Mobile 918.327.0149

dmclain@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

 

 

From: daryl@turfhub.com <daryl@turfhub.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 1:37 PM
To: heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>; kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>; David McLain
<dmclain@scottandreid.com>
Subject: Estimate 3697 from TurfHub Dallas, LLC
 
 EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.

[Quoted text hidden]

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Fri, Jul 21, 2023 at 11:43 AM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>
Cc: "daryl@turfhub.com" <daryl@turfhub.com>, "heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com" <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, Tami Jackson <tjackson@scottandreid.com>

Daryl,
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mailto:daryl@turfhub.com
mailto:daryl@turfhub.com
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I believe the Turf Hub W-9 is the only document missing for Heartland Sports Turf. If I can be of any assistance
please let me know.

Kenneth
[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]

Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> Fri, Jul 21, 2023 at 12:14 PM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>
Cc: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, "kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com" <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>, Tami Jackson <tjackson@scottandreid.com>

Hello David I am waiting for my accountant to fwd me the W-9 form. As soon as I get that document I will send your way along with a payment link should order be approved. As
for point of contact once given green light I will place the order to get picked up for job site delivery. ETA on delivery would be within 24hours from pick up.

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006

On Jul 21, 2023, at 7:54 AM, David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com> wrote:

Daryl,

Can you send me your W9 as well?

Also, who will be the point of contact for purchasing so I can give that to our client?

http://www.turfhub.com/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/1725+E+Germann+Rd+Ste+19+Chandler,+AZ+85286?entry=gmail&source=g
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Thank you 

<Outlook-
4f2wzl0v.png>

David McLain | Project Engineer
Scott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.
Mobile 918.327.0149
dmclain@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

 
 
[Quoted text hidden]
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Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> Fri, Jul 21, 2023 at 12:32 PM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>
Cc: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, "kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com" <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>, Tami Jackson <tjackson@scottandreid.com>

Hello please find attached form per your request. Feel free to let me know should you have any other questions. 

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006

On Jul 21, 2023, at 10:14 AM, Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> wrote:

Hello David I am waiting for my accountant to fwd me the W-9 form. As soon as I get that document I will send your way along with a payment link should order be
approved. As for point of contact once given green light I will place the order to get picked up for job site delivery. ETA on delivery would be within 24hours from pick
up.

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
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800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006

<PastedGraphic-1.tiff>

On Jul 21, 2023, at 7:54 AM, David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com> wrote:

Daryl,

Can you send me your W9 as well?

Also, who will be the point of contact for purchasing so I can give that to our client?

Thank you 

<Outlook-
4f2wzl0v.png>

David McLain | Project Engineer
Scott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.
Mobile 918.327.0149
dmclain@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

 
 

From: daryl@turfhub.com <daryl@turfhub.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 1:37 PM
To: heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>; kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com<kennet
h@heartlandsportsturf.com>; David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>
Subject: Estimate 3697 from TurfHub Dallas, LLC
 

 EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.
Dear Jason MacMahan:

Please review the attached estimate- 3697. Feel free to contact us if you have any questions.

We look forward to working with you.

Sincerely,
TurfHub Dallas, LLC

972-245-1566
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2 attachments

PastedGraphic-1.tiff
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W-9 TurfHub.pdf
1305K

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Fri, Jul 21, 2023 at 1:41 PM
To: tjackson@scottandreid.com

Tami,

Making sure you received the W9 for Turf Hub. 

Kenneth

[Quoted text hidden]

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006

On Jul 21, 2023, at 10:14 AM, Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> wrote:

Hello David I am waiting for my accountant to fwd me the W-9 form. As soon as I get that document I will send your way along with a payment link should order be
approved. As for point of contact once given green light I will place the order to get picked up for job site delivery. ETA on delivery would be within 24hours from pick
up.

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
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1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006

<PastedGraphic-1.tiff>

On Jul 21, 2023, at 7:54 AM, David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com> wrote:

Daryl,

Can you send me your W9 as well?

Also, who will be the point of contact for purchasing so I can give that to our client?

Thank you 

<Outlook-
4f2wzl0v.png>

David McLain | Project Engineer
Scott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.
Mobile 918.327.0149
dmclain@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

 
 

From: daryl@turfhub.com <daryl@turfhub.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 1:37 PM
To: heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>; kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com<kennet
h@heartlandsportsturf.com>; David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>
Subject: Estimate 3697 from TurfHub Dallas, LLC
 

 EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.
Dear Jason MacMahan:

Please review the attached estimate- 3697. Feel free to contact us if you have any questions.

We look forward to working with you.

Sincerely,
TurfHub Dallas, LLC

972-245-1566
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[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

PastedGraphic-1.tiff
50K

W-9 TurfHub.pdf
1305K

Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> Mon, Oct 2, 2023 at 12:50 PM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>, Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>, Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>

https://connect.intuit.com/portal/app/CommerceNetwork/view/scs-v1-26e52a6e48804a2f960904a343de58de225ae8d107844822a1deafaf17a2
6cf96a9ef25866244e2aac59b70ea5999fc5?locale=EN_US

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006

On Aug 9, 2023, at 2:10 PM, David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com> wrote:

Daryl,

Do you have a new vendor packet I can send to my client so they can get set up in your system?
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Thank you 

<Outlook-
e2djuksw.png>

David McLain | Project Engineer

Scott + Reid General Contractors, Inc.

Mobile 918.327.0149

dmclain@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

 

 

From: Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com>
Sent: Friday, July 21, 2023 12:32 PM
To: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>
Cc: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>; kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>; Tami Jackson
<tjackson@scottandreid.com>
Subject: Re: Estimate 3697 from TurfHub Dallas, LLC
 
 EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.

Hello please find attached form per your request. Feel free to let me know should you have any other questions. 

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006

On Jul 21, 2023, at 10:14 AM, Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> wrote:

Hello David I am waiting for my accountant to fwd me the W-9 form. As soon as I get that document I will send your way along with a payment link
should order be approved. As for point of contact once given green light I will place the order to get picked up for job site delivery. ETA on delivery
would be within 24hours from pick up.

Best Regards,
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Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006
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[Quoted text hidden]
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Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Mon, Oct 2, 2023 at 1:30 PM
To: Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com>

Interesting…
[Quoted text hidden]
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Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Mon, Oct 2, 2023 at 1:33 PM
To: Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com>

Who they setting up?
[Quoted text hidden]
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Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> Mon, Oct 2, 2023 at 1:34 PM
To: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>
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It’s a payment link because the first one is gone somehow. 
[Quoted text hidden]
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Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Mon, Oct 2, 2023 at 1:40 PM
To: Christopher Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>

[Quoted text hidden]
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Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Mon, Oct 2, 2023 at 1:41 PM
To: Christopher Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>

They were adamant it was already paid. That’s what I wanted to verify. I’ll be glad when this is over. 
[Quoted text hidden]
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