
Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>
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Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> Fri, Jul 14, 2023 at 2:16 PM
To: kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com

Hi Kenneth, I appreciate your call. Please let me know what other info you will need from us and you can let the GC know we will submit a payment link via email which will be a
bank to bank transfer. Should you have any other questions please let me know.

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006
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Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Fri, Jul 14, 2023 at 2:17 PM
To: Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com>

Thank you, I will let you know.

http://www.turfhub.com/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/1725+E+Germann+Rd+Ste+19+Chandler,+AZ+85286?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/1725+E+Germann+Rd+Ste+19+Chandler,+AZ+85286?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/1500+Luna+Rd+Ste+106+Carrollton,+TX+75006?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/1500+Luna+Rd+Ste+106+Carrollton,+TX+75006?entry=gmail&source=g
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=6bc6de5cfc&view=att&th=18955d501582ad03&attid=0.1.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=6bc6de5cfc&view=att&th=18955d501582ad03&attid=0.1.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw


Good afternoon, Subs,

 

As you probably know, the Otoe-Missouria Tribe will be purchasing the materials for the project.  I am needing all supplier information
including name, billing contact address, phone number, w9 and the amount for direct pay for the owner.  Please send me this information
as soon as possible, as this job is short in duration and we need to get the information to the owners, so that materials can be ordered. 
Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

 Per Tami @ Scott & Reid. 

Ken

[Quoted text hidden]
--
Kenneth R. Crawford
HeartlandSportsTurf.com
405-642-9592
Brian Crawford Memorial 
BCM Sports
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Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Fri, Jul 14, 2023 at 11:25 PM
To: Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com>

Good evening. 

I am hoping you can share some forms or Oder sheets that Turf Hub may be able to provide us with. Jason may have something but I’m not sure. I’d like to develop an app for
us to use in estimates and placing orders. I believe this could streamline the process and be very beneficial for Jason. 

A complete list of products, equipment, or anything we could possible order for a job (buffet list) if that makes sense. 

An exported csv or excel sheet with product info would be really helpful. 

Kenneth
[Quoted text hidden]
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Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> Mon, Jul 17, 2023 at 2:05 PM
To: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Hi Kenneth apologize for the delay. Hope you had a wonderful weekend. To get back to you unfortunately we do not have order forms we provide. Typically y’all just let us know
what the sqft of the project is and I send over a detailed estimate with specific cuts if needed.  I am more than happy to send some more samples as well which I believe Jason
has the ones he prefers. I have attached product and accessories pricing for you. Please note pricing subject to change based on size of project as well.  Please let me know if
there is anything else I can help with and ill gladly do my best. 

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006

On Jul 14, 2023, at 9:25 PM, Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> wrote:

Good evening. 

I am hoping you can share some forms or Oder sheets that Turf Hub may be able to provide us with. Jason may have something but I’m not sure. I’d like to
develop an app for us to use in estimates and placing orders. I believe this could streamline the process and be very beneficial for Jason. 

A complete list of products, equipment, or anything we could possible order for a job (buffet list) if that makes sense. 

An exported csv or excel sheet with product info would be really helpful. 

Kenneth

On Fri, Jul 14, 2023 at 2:17 PM Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> wrote:
Thank you, I will let you know.

Good afternoon, Subs,
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As you probably know, the Otoe-Missouria Tribe will be purchasing the materials for the project.  I am needing all supplier
information including name, billing contact address, phone number, w9 and the amount for direct pay for the owner.  Please
send me this information as soon as possible, as this job is short in duration and we need to get the information to the
owners, so that materials can be ordered.  Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

 Per Tami @ Scott & Reid. 

Ken

On Fri, Jul 14, 2023 at 2:16 PM Daryl Arreola <daryl@turfhub.com> wrote:
Hi Kenneth, I appreciate your call. Please let me know what other info you will need from us and you can let the GC know we will submit a payment link via
email which will be a bank to bank transfer. Should you have any other questions please let me know.

Best Regards,

Daryl Arreola
National Account Manager 
706-513-6664(C)
800-383-8229(O)
www.turfhub.com
1725 E Germann Rd Ste 19
Chandler, AZ 85286
1500 Luna Rd Ste 106
Carrollton, TX 75006
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Kenneth R. Crawford
HeartlandSportsTurf.com
405-642-9592
Brian Crawford Memorial 
BCM Sports
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Kenneth R. Crawford
HeartlandSportsTurf.com
405-642-9592
Brian Crawford Memorial 
BCM Sports
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