@: ’ . Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Re: Pay

2 messages

Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com> Fri, Jul 12, 2024 at 7:57 AM
To: Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>

Cc: Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>, David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>, Jason McMahan
<jason@heartlandsportsturf.com>, Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, Kenneth Crawford
<kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Thanks Eden... isn’t this why our pay app is off? If you remember, we initially included both of those co’s on a previous pay app...

With that said, are we to submit a pay app showing these CO’s and the r my
to be paid?

Let me know so | can submit a pay app prior to the end of the day.
Thanks & Happy Friday!

Christopher T. Wilson
D: (405) 215-7726
heartlandsportsturf.com

On Fri, Jul 12, 2024 at 6:41 AM Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com> wrote:
Chris,
Yes, Joseph has been working on this.
Thanks,
Eden

ﬁ Eden Evans
o

Project Manager

P 918.359.2754 M 918.606.7195
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General Contractors

On Jul 12, 2024, at 5:19AM, Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com> wrote:

EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.

Eden,

Are we still working on getting the security footage to officially include these 2 change orders we’ve been in discussion
on?

Christopher T. Wilson
D: (405) 215-7726
heartlandsportsturf.com

On Mon, Jul 8, 2024 at 9:35AM Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com> wrote:

Jason,

We are waiting for stamped engineered drawings from 360E that Narcomey is working on. The O/A will
not approve the pay app until this has been done. We are pushing daily on this.


http://heartlandsportsturf.com/
mailto:eevans@scottandreid.com
mailto:eevans@scottandreid.com
https://www.scottandreid.com/
mailto:chris@heartlandsportsturf.com
http://heartlandsportsturf.com/
mailto:eevans@scottandreid.com

Thank you,
Eden

Eden Evans
Project Manager

P 918.359.2754 M 918.606.7195
eevans@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

CONFIDENTIAL & PRIVILEGED: Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the nature of the following communication, the
information contained herein is privileged and confidential information/work product. The communication is intended for the use
of the individual or entity named above. If the reader of this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error or are not sure whether it is privileged, please immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy any
copies, electronic, paper or otherwise, which you may have of this communication.

From: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, July 8, 2024 9:33 AM

To: Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>

Subject: Pay

EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.

Eden it's Jason McMahan just wanted to touch base with you on our pay app and phase 3 contract if we got it or
not

Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com> Fri, Jul 12, 2024 at 8:02 AM
To: "Christopher T. Wilson" <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Cc: Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>, David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>, Jason McMahan
<jason@heartlandsportsturf.com>, Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, Kenneth Crawford
<kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

No, we paid you for those SCO’s. You are paid in full minus retention.

ﬁ Eden Evans
\ - :
" Project Manager

P 918.359.2754 M 918.606.7195

SCOTT + REID ; )
eevans@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com

General Contractors

[Quoted text hidden]


mailto:eevans@scottandreid.com
http://www.scottandreid.com/
http://www.scottandreid.com/
mailto:heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com
mailto:eevans@scottandreid.com
mailto:eevans@scottandreid.com
https://www.scottandreid.com/

