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Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com> Thu, May 9, 2024 at 10:37 AM
To: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

7 Clans PH 1 Repair Quote Copy 05-09-24 copy copy.xlsx
273K

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Fri, May 10, 2024 at 8:17 AM
To: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>

FYI-

Both of Chris’s PH 1 & 2 repair invoices = $52,523.00 that was recently sent to you. 

Kenneth R. Crawford
HeartlandSportsTurf.com
405-642-9592
Brian Crawford Memorial 
BCM Sports

On Thu, May 9, 2024 at 10:37 AM Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com> wrote:
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