@: ’ . Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Fwd: RV Park Phase 2 - Pay Application - April

1 message

Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com> Thu, Apr 11, 2024 at 10:13 AM
To: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>

Date: Thu, Apr 11, 2024 at 10:07AM

Subject: RV Park Phase 2 - Pay Application - April

To: travisplumbing@sbcglobal.net <travisplumbing@sbcglobal.net>, taylor hodge <truthexcavationco@gmail.com>,
heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, Kayla Murphy <kmurphy@evans-assoc.com>, Shea Walker
<sheawalker46@gmail.com>, dylon@maycofixture.com <dylon@maycofixture.com>, Kevin Lewis <kevin@lewisroofing.com>,
Accounting <Accounting@cdhwbe.com>, Tim Jackson <tjackson@narcomey-construction.com>, Bryan Adson <bryan@narcomey-
construction.com>, Yoko Elizondo <yoko@acuraneon.com>, David Hazelwood <dahazelwood@yahoo.com>, Colton Dell
<coltondell@gmail.com>, Adam <ccfahlborn@gmail.com>

CC: David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>

Subs,

Please be reminded that pay applications are due to me 4/15. Bill through end of the month 4/30/24. Always use our S+R Standard
Invoice Form attached as a coversheet to your pay application.

Let me know if you have any questions.
Thank you,

Eden

Eden Evans
.- » Project Manager
\-‘
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ﬂ SCOTT + REID Standard Invoice Form.pdf
338K
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