
Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Fwd: FW: RV Park Phase 2_PayApp2 ODPITurfhub OM3-2023-75-ODPI-01
4 messages

Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com> Thu, Mar 7, 2024 at 4:25 PM
To: "Christopher T. Wilson" <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>, Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

What is this ?

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>
Date: Thu, Mar 7, 2024 at 4:02 PM
Subject: FW: RV Park Phase 2_PayApp2 ODPITurfhub OM3-2023-75-ODPI-01
To: heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>
CC: Brian Travis <btravis@scottandreid.com>, David McLain <dmclain@scottandreid.com>, Joseph McLain
<jmclain@scottandreid.com>

Jason,

Please see attached.  This should get you to go ahead and order your turf.

Thanks,

Eden

 

Eden Evans
Project Manager

   
P 918.359.2754  M 918.606.7195
eevans@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com 

CONFIDENTIAL & PRIVILEGED: Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the nature of the following communication, the
information contained herein is privileged and confidential information/work product. The communication is intended for the use
of the individual or entity named above.  If the reader of this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited.   If you have received this
communication in error or are not sure whether it is privileged, please immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy any
copies, electronic, paper or otherwise, which you may have of this communication.

From: Annette Arkeketa <Annette.Arkeketa@om3construction.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 7, 2024 3:22 PM
To: Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>
Cc: Tami Jackson <tjackson@scottandreid.com>; Phyllis Narcomey <phyllis.narcomey@om3construction.com>
Subject: RV Park Phase 2_PayApp2 ODPITurfhub OM3-2023-75-ODPI-01
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 EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.

Eden and Tami,

 

Please see the attached.

 

Annette Arkeketa

Contract Administrator

OM3 Construction/OMDA

4111 Perimeter Center Pl.

Oklahoma City, OK  73112

Cell phone:  405-540-0019

annette.arkeketa@OM3construction.com

 

Otoe-Missouria Tribe of Oklahoma

 

 

TURFH CK OM3-2023-75-ODPI-01.pdf
104K

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Thu, Mar 7, 2024 at 6:58 PM
To: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>

Looks like a copy of a check sent to turf hub but no check to HST?

Kenneth R. Crawford
HeartlandSportsTurf.com
405-642-9592
Brian Crawford Memorial 
BCM Sports
[Quoted text hidden]
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Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com> Fri, Mar 8, 2024 at 6:48 AM
To: Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Well it is only for 4 rolls of turf and I need 15  rolls
[Quoted text hidden]

Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com> Sat, Apr 6, 2024 at 11:40 AM
To: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>

Is this all that’s been compensated to date? HST receive any compensation to date?Did we get a mobilization fee? I’ve scanned in all
email documentation I have seen. I researched my BCM & HST accounts. 

Kenneth R. Crawford
HeartlandSportsTurf.com
405-642-9592
Brian Crawford Memorial 
BCM Sports
[Quoted text hidden]
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