@: ’ . Kenneth Crawford <kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Re: RV Park - Phase 2 - Turf

1 message

Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com> Thu, Dec 28, 2023 at 9:58 AM
To: Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>

Cc: Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>, Tami Jackson <tjackson@scottandreid.com>

Bcc: kenneth@heartlandsportsturf.com

Eden,

Thank you for the information!
What about the phase 2 contract?
Christopher T. Wilson

D: (405) 215-7726

heartlandsportsturf.com
crawfordconsultingenterprises.com

On Thu, Dec 28, 2023 at 8:59AM Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com> wrote:
We got the checks from accounting yesterday. Tami will reach out today for pick up.

Eden Evans

Project Manager [ Facebook
P 918.359.2754 M 918.606.7195 |#.LinkedIn
eevans@scottandreid.com | www.scottandreid.com lo Instagram

|"J-Scott + Reid Banner

CONFIDENTIAL & PRIVILEGED: Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the nature of the following communication, the
information contained herein is privileged and confidential information/work product. The communication is intended for the use
of the individual or entity named above. If the reader of this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error or are not sure whether it is privileged, please immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy any
copies, electronic, paper or otherwise, which you may have of this communication.

On Dec 28, 2023, at 8:56 AM, Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com> wrote:

EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.

Eden,

We need an update on this please... in particular phase 1 payment.

We've been continually told it's coming, along with the phase 2 contract - but we’'ve seen neither to date...
What the heck is the deal?

Sincerely,

Christopher T. Wilson

D: (405) 215-7726

heartlandsportsturf.com
crawfordconsultingenterprises.com
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com>

Date: Wed, Dec 27, 2023 at 6:30 PM

Subject: Re: RV Park - Phase 2 - Turf

To: Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com>, Jason McMahan <heartlandsportsturf@gmail.com>

Eden,
Any update on the phase 2 contract or phase 1 payment?
Thanks!

Christopher T. Wilson

D: (405) 215-7726
heartlandsportsturf.com
crawfordconsultingenterprises.com

On Wed, Dec 20, 2023 at 3:43 PM Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com> wrote:

Chris,

We will have to do this next month as | already sent the pay app to the Tribe. If you can get me an invoice for turf, for
next month, that would be great.

Thanks,

Eden

Eden Evans
Project Manager
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CONFIDENTIAL & PRIVILEGED: Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the nature of the following communication, the
information contained herein is privileged and confidential information/work product. The communication is intended for the use
of the individual or entity named above. If the reader of this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error or are not sure whether it is privileged, please immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy any
copies, electronic, paper or otherwise, which you may have of this communication.

On Dec 20, 2023, at 5:04 AM, Christopher T. Wilson <chris@heartlandsportsturf.com> wrote:

EXTERNAL SENDER: Use caution before replying, clicking links, and opening attachments.

Eden,

Will be sending this Wednesday morning. My apologies | was unable to get it to you on Tuesday.
Thanks!

Christopher T. Wilson

D: (405) 215-7726
heartlandsportsturf.com

On Mon, Dec 18, 2023 at 3:07 PM Eden Evans <eevans@scottandreid.com> wrote:
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Chris,

Is there a way you could get an invoice for turf for Phase 2 so we can get working on including it in
the owner pay app?

Thanks,

Eden

Eden Evans
Project Manager
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CONFIDENTIAL & PRIVILEGED: Unless otherwise indicated or obvious from the nature of the following communication, the
information contained herein is privileged and confidential information/work product. The communication is intended for the use
of the individual or entity named above. If the reader of this transmission is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error or are not sure whether it is privileged, please immediately notify us by return e-mail and destroy any
copies, electronic, paper or otherwise, which you may have of this communication.
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